
Alana Barton
‘Lour’

2023
Oil and acrylic
50x60cm

Alanabarton.com

£1,600

Cathy Scullion
‘Interwoven I’

2021
Tracing paper, ink, thread
26x32cm

@cscullionart

£100

Cathy Scullion
‘Interwoven II’

2021
Tracing paper, ink, thread
26x32cm

@cscullionart

£100



Cathy Scullion
‘Interwoven III’

2021
Tracing paper, ink, thread
26x32cm

@cscullionart

£100

Ciara O’Malley
‘Waiting’

2023
Digital
45x20cm

£180

Ciara O’Malley
‘Unexpected’

2023
Digital print on perspex
29.7x21cm

£60

Ciara O’Malley
‘Underneath’

2023
Digital print on perspex
29.7x21cm

£60

Dragos Musat
‘Bearboy’

2022
Pastel on paper
60x84cm

@dragos.design

£300



Dragos Musat
‘Intergenerational’

2022
Pastel on paper
60x84cm

@dragos.design

£300

Ed Reynolds
‘Long Line’

2023
Oil on gesso panel
30x40cm

Steadyhanded.com

£250

Ed Reynolds
‘Taking Turns’

2023
Oil on gesso panel
30x40cm

Steadyhanded.com

£250



Ed Reynolds
‘Studio View #2’

2023
Oil on gesso panel
30x40cm

Steadyhanded.com

£180

Esther O’Kelly
‘GLÁS’

2023
Mixed media on canvas
51x76cm

www.estherokelly.com

£1,250

Hannah Smith
‘Dublin Man’

2022
Oil on canvas
66x77cm

www.paintsofhannah.com

£1,000



John Baucher
‘After the Fear’

2023
Mixed media on board, acrylic
paint, watercolour pencil, flag
fragments antique engraving
(face of fear) Japanese rice
past.
20x20cm

@moochinphotoman

£300

John Baucher
‘What about them onions?’

2023
Retrieved flag on board,
Japanese rice paste, triangled
Tayto cheese and onion
packets, found drug bags,
correction fluid, antique
engravings, one of the facial
expression disdain, the other
sectional drawing of Mauser
rifle, butterfly, 2 retrieved flag
eyelets and red braided flag.
40x30cm

£400

John Baucher
‘Cultural erosion - I’m doing my
nails’

2023
Flag fragment, emery board,
Japanese rice paste on canvas
20x20cm

@moochinphotoman

£150

John Samuel Macormac
‘Triangle Field’

2023
0.5mm micron pen on A4 paper
29.7x21cm

@johnmacormac

£250



Jonathan Brennan
‘Veil’

2021
Cyanotype
34.5x34.5cm

www.jonathanbrennanart.com

£150

Jonathan Brennan
‘Kelp(ie)’

2021
Cyanotype
34.5x34.5cm

www.jonathanbrennanart.com

£150

Jonathan Brennan
‘3 Cornered Leek’

2021
Cyanotype
34.5x34.5cm

www.jonathanbrennanart.com

£150

Jonny McEwen
‘Head VII’

2023
Ink on yupo paper
42x59cm

@jmcewenart

£850



Laura Nelson
‘The Raindrops’

2023
Medium- Enamel and 23ct gold
reverse glass water gild.
30x30cm

@szuszusignco

£140

Laura Nelson
‘The Watcher’

2023
Medium- Enamel and 23ct gold
reverse glass water gild.
30x30cm

@szuszusignco

£160

Leo Boyd
‘Whoopsie’

2023
Found street sign with spray
paint

@leoboydprints

£300

Leo Boyd
‘That’s Nice Dear’

2023
Repurposed Silk Screen with
paint

@leoboydprints

£300



Raquel Amat Parra
‘The life of Melaluca’

2019
Stone Lithography
70x100cm

@raquel_amat_parra

£390

Rob Hilken
‘Splat! In pink and green’

2023
Acrylic and spray paint on
canvas
70x50cm

@robhilken

£800

Rob Hilken
‘Splat! In orange and purple’

2022
Acrylic and spray paint on
canvas
30x42cm

@robhilken

£350

Rob Hilken
‘Splat! In grey and orange’

2022
Acrylic and spray paint on
canvas
30x30cm

@robhilken

£300



Sally O’Dowd
‘Women at Work: The Anaka
Collective making Funky
Ferments at the Cultured Club,
Belfast’

2022
Archival pen on Cotton
94x76cm

@sallyspectre

£1,250

Wendynicole
McGuinness-Keys
‘“Mamma” (Succour)’

2023
Mixed media on found textile
21x30cm

£150

Wilhelmina Peace
‘The Dreaming of Swans’

2022
Sumi ink on Heritage paper
52x70cm

@wilhelminapeace

£480



Wilhelmina Peace
‘In The Antechamber’

2022
Sumi ink on Heritage paper
52x70cm

@wilhelminapeace

£490

Wilhelmina Peace
‘Trial by Fire’

2022
Sumi ink on Heritage paper
52x70cm

@wilhelminapeace

£340

The following works were donated to Vault by london-based street artist Ed Hicks. Ed was based at Vault
for a Seedhead Arts project in 2023 and they kindly donated these works to raise money for the studio as
a departing gift.

Ed Hicks
‘Untitled Portrait’

2023
Spray paint on wood’
44x78cm

@ed_hicks

£350



Ed Hicks
‘Untitled Landscape’

2023
Spray paint on wood’
46x92cm

@ed_hicks

£350


